St 117 East Columbus Avenue
LOGAN Suite 100 ¢ Bellefontaine, Oh 43311
: commissioners@co.logan.oh.us
Corr:r;lli’s"s'riar‘:e“rl; (office) 937-599-7283 + (fax) 937-599-7268

Joe Antram « Paul Benedetti + Mark Robinson

Brian Dunn DeDe Doss
Special Projects Coordinator Clerk Administrator

Resolution No. 84-21

The Logan County Board of Commissioners met in regular open session on this date of March 23, 2021
with full board present.

Mr. Mark Robinson moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RE: AWARD BID TO THE SHELLY COMPANY- 2021 COUNTY PAVING PROJECT
WHEREAS, bids were received on March 18, 2021 for the 2021 County Paving Project
WHEREAS, one bid was received from The Shelly Company in the amount of $1,091,537.00, and

WHEREAS, the bid has been reviewed by the Logan County Engineer and a recommendation has been made to
accept the bid of Ray Hensley, Inc. and enter into a contract of the same.

THEREFORE, BE IT HEREBY RESOLVED, by the Logan County Board of Commissioners to accept the bid of
The Shelly Company in the amount of $1,091,537.00 and enter into a contract for the same.

Mr. Joe Antram seconded the motion.
Roll call resulted as follows:

FO0& L yea

Mr. Paul Benedetti, President

/Z////;_ L

“"Mr. Mark Robinson, Vice President /

Mr. ;%seph M. Angam, Member Lj

I, De De Doss, Clerk/Administrator, hereby certify this to be a true copy of the proceedings as taken from the
minutes of the meeting of the Logan County Commissioners on this date of March 23, 2021.

L)\

De De Doss, Clerk/Administrator

G:\Commissioners\Clerk\Admin Clerk\2021 Resolutions\84-21 Award Bid 2021 County Paving
Project.doc, Page 1 of 1



OFFICE OF THE

LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER
P.O. BOX 427

1991 COUNTY ROAD 13

BELLEFONTAINE, OH 43311

www.lceo.us

SCOTT C. COLEMAN, P.E., P.S.
LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER

March 18, 2021

The Honorable Board of

Logan County Commissioners
117 E. Columbus Avenue, Suite 100

Bellefontaine, OH 43311

Re: 2021 County Paving Project
Thursday, March 18, 2021 at 10:00 A.M. — Bid Opening

Gentlemen:

Telephone: (937) 592-2791
Fax: (937) 599-2658

I have reviewed the bid which was received and opened in your office at the above date and time. The low and only
bid of The Shelly Company appears to be responsive meeting all specifications. The bid tab is as follows.

Amount

Method of Payment

The Shelly
Company

Responsive Bid

$ 1,091,537.00

Auto & Gas and Sales Tax

Therefore, I am recommending that your honorable board adopt a resolution awarding the bid to The Shelly
Company, 1700 Fostoria Avenue, Suite 200, P.O. Box 3100, Findlay, Ohio 45840, in the amount of one million
ninety-one thousand five hundred thirty-seven dollars and zero cents ($1,091,537.00) and enter into a contract for

the same.

In accordance with ORC 9.24, we have checked the Auditor of State’s Unresolved Findings for Recovery Database
and the federal system for awards management. The Shelly Company was not listed and we have retained the

certified search confirmation page in the project file.

Respectfully submitted,

At L. L

Scott C. Coleman, P.E., P.S.
Logan County Engineer

SCC/wtb

APP

NOVED BY THE BOARD OF

LOGAN COUNTY COMMISSIGNERS

MOTION

2ND

ME.
7%

DATED

PER RESOLUTIONZ __ 84 -4

Alan]hl
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General Info

Total:
$1,091,537.00

Number

2021 - Logan County, Ohio -
County Roadway Resurfacing

Deadline

03/18/2021 02:00 PM UTC
Vendor

Shelly Company - Northwest
Submitted

03/18/2021 12:25 PM UTC
Signed by

Timothy Oberst

Opened

03/18/2021 02:07 PM UTC By
tbumgardner@lceo.us

Description

Logan County Engineer's 2021 Local Funded Resurfacing Program.

for resurfacing various county roads throughout Logan County.
Estimate: $1,094,813.00

Allows zero unit prices and labor
Yes
Allows negative unit prices and labor

Yes
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ATTACHMENT LIST

2021 Sales Tax Resurfacing NTB.pdf (188 KB)

2021 Sales Tax Resurfacing Instructions, Conditions, and General Notes.pdf (400 KB)
2021 Sales Tax Resurfacing Detail and Estimate.pdf (189 KB)

2021 Prevailing Wage Rates.pdf (366 KB)

2021 Sales Tax Resurfacing Addendum #1.pdf (60.9 KB)
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ADDENDUM

Addendum Acknowledgement: (Click "+" to add additional fields) (Type "N/A" if not applicable)
Addendum Number: *

#1

Addendum Date: *

3/4/21
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AFFIDAVIT - CAMPAIGN CONTRIBUTIONS

Ohio Revised Code Section 3517.13(l) requires that no agency or department of this state or any political
subdivision shall award any contract, other than one let by competitive bidding or a contract incidental to
such contract or which is by force account, for the purchase of goods costing more than five hundred
dollars or services costing more than five hundred dollars to any individual, partnership, association,
including, without limitation, a professional association organized under Chapter 1785 of the ORC, estate,
or trust if the individual has made or the individual's spouse has made, or any partner, shareholder,
administrator, executor, or trustee or the spouse of any of them has made, as an individual, within the two
previous calendar years, one or more contributions totaling in excess of one thousand dollars to the holder
of the public office having ultimate responsibility for the award of the contract or to the public officer's
campaign committee. Furthermore, Ohio Revised Code Section 3517.13(J) requires that no agency or
department of this state or any political subdivision shall award any contract, other than one let by
competitive bidding or a contract incidental to such contract or which is by force account, for the purchase
of goods costing more than five hundred dollars or services costing more than five hundred dollars to a
corporation or business trust, except a professional association organized under Chapter 1785 of the ORC,
if an owner of more than twenty per cent of the corporation or business trust or the spouse of that person
has made, as an individual, within the two previous calendar years, taking into consideration only owners
for all of that period, one or more contributions totaling in excess of one thousand dollars to the holder of a
public office having ultimate responsibility for the award of the contract or to the public officer’'s campaign
committee. Execution of this proposal on the signature portion thereof shall constitute also signature of this
Campaign Contributions Affidavit.
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AFFIDAVIT - NON-COLLUSION

In accordance with Title 23 United States Code, Section 112 and Ohio Revised Code, Chapter 1331 et. seq: and Sections 2921.11
and 2921.13, the bidder hereby states, under penalty of perjury and under other such penalties as the law provides, that he or his
agents or employees have not entered either directly or indirectly into any agreement, participated in any collusion, or otherwise
taken any action in restraint of free competitive bidding in connection with this proposal. Execution of this proposal on the
signature portion thereof shall constitute also signature of this Non-Collusion Affidavit.
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AFFIDAVIT - PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX

PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX *

N/A
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
. 88!

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County,
Ohio, and that:

No bid

The business address of the bidder is: *

No bid

Telephone: *
No bid

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *
No bid

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" if this section does not
apply):

YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *

No bid No bid No bid No bid

Signature: *
No bid

Title: *
No bid
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP
DBA

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
: ss:

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County,
Ohio, and that:

No bid

of: *

No bid

The business address of the bidder is: *

No bid

Telephone: *
No bid

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *
No bid

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" if this section does not
apply):
YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *

No bid No bid No bid No bid

Signature: *
No bid

Title: *
No bid
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - PARTNERSHIP

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
: ss:

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County,
Ohio, and that:

No bid

known as: *
No bid

The business address of the bidder is: *

No bid

Telephone: *
No bid

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *
No bid

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows {click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" if this section does not
apply):
YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *

No bid No bid No bid No bid

Signature: *
No bid

Title: *
No bid
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - CORPORATION

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
. 88!

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County,
Ohio, and that:

[VHeis a duly authorized officer of the corporation *

named: *
T.A. Oberst

The business address of the bidder is: *

1700 Fostoria Ave, Ste 200

Telephone: *
(419) 422-8854

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *

Was not charged with any delinquient personal taxes in Logan County, Ohio.

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" if this section does not
apply):

YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *
N/A $.00 $.00 $.00
Signature: *
T.A. Oberst
Title: *

Vice President
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BIDDER INFORMATION

Company *

The Shelly Company

Submitted by *
Timothy Oberst

Street, Post Office, City, State and Zip: *
1700 Fostoria Ave, Findlay, OH 45840

Telephone *
(419) 422-8854 x3401

Federal Tax ID# *
31-1279704
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County Road 2

$682,332.00
Item Code Description Quantity Units Unit Price Extension
10 Tack 6,576 gal $2.00 $13,152.00
20 404 LVT PG 58-28 7,344 ton $87.00 $638,928.00
30 Mill Butt Joint 8 ea $325.00 $2,600.00
40 617 Berm, Type A 778 ton $34.00 $26,452.00
50 Temp Pavement Marking 8 mile $150.00 $1,200.00

Page 12 of 17

Total: $682,332.00

03/18/2021



County Road 20

$202,656.00
Item Code Description Quantity Units Unit Price Extension
10 Tack 1,832 gal $2.00 $3,864.00
20 404 LVT PG 58-28 2,157 ton $87.00 $187,659.00
30 Mill Butt Joint 2 ea $325.00 $650.00
40 617 Berm, Type A 254 ton $39.50 $10,033.00
50 Temp Pavement Marking 3 mile $150.00 $450.00
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Total: $202,656.00
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County Road 63

$206,549.00
Item Code Description Quantity Units Unit Price Extension
10 Tack 1,940 gal $2.00 $3,880.00
20 404 LVT PG 58-28 2,167 ton $89.00 $192,863.00
30 Mill Butt Jaint 2 ea $325.00 $650.00
40 617 Berm, Type A 216 ton $41.00 $8,856.00
50 Temp Pavement Marking 2  mile $150.00 $300.00
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Total: $206,549.00
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REQUIRED DOCUMENTS LIST

Name

Paper Bid Bond, Certified Check, Cashier's
Check

Please upload a copy of your paper bid bond
here.

Certificate of Compliance with Affirmative Action
Program

Issued by the State EEO Coordinator dated prior
to the date fixed for the opening of bid

Ohio workers’ compensation certificate of
coverage
Submitted prior to contract execution

404 LVT PG 58-28 Mix Design
Please upload mix design here

4 Required Documents

Omission Terms

| have electronically verified my bid bond in the
"Bid Bond" section above.

| will furnish prior to contract award

| will furnish prior to contract award

Page 15 of 17

Submitted
File

915004 Bid
Guaranty and
Contract
Bond.pdf

DAS Certificate
of Compliance
Approval - exp
5.21.2021
Shelly
Company.pdf

BWC Expires
2021 0801.pdf

Bid 915004
Logan Co.
2021 Various
Co. Roads
(Belle
Center).pdf
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BID GUARANTY

As specified in the Ohio Revised Code 153.54, a bidder must submit a bid guaranty in the form of either:
(1) a paper contract bond for the full amount (100%) of the bid, or

(2) a certified check, cashier's check, or letter of credit in the amount of 10% of the bid.

(3) an electronic bid bond for 10% of the bid.

Bond Percentage
10.00%

Guarantee Method *

Paper Bid Bond, Certified
Check, Cashier's Check,

Letter of Credit, or Paper
Contract Bond

|7I understand that original, wet-ink bid guaranty documents will be recieved “within 3-days post bid deadline.” *

Paper Bid Bond, Certified Check, Cashier's Check, Letter of Credit, or Paper Contract Bond

Confirmation *

| have provided a Contract Bond for 100.00% of the bid total amount and have uploaded a
copy in the Required Documents List at the bottom of this solicitation.

Page 16 of 17
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BIDDERS CERTIFICATION:

The undersigned, being a duly authorized officer of the prime contract bidder, does hereby certify to and agree to all the
required contract provisions and documents outlined within the final plans, wage rates, utility notes, proposal notes, and
bidders notices each furnished in their entirety within the attachment list above.

The undersigned, being a duly authorized officer of the prime contract bidder, does hereby agrees to furnish all labor,
materials, and equipment for the (project listed in the general info section) and perform all work incident thereto in accordance
with the plans and specifications thereof and subject to the satisfaction and acceptance by the County Engineer at the unit
prices provided on the proceeding pages.

The undersigned, being a duly authorized officer of the prime contract bidder, does hereby agrees to enter into a contract
within ten (10) days; to complete the said improvement and will furnish the required bond for the payment of all bills for
damages, labor, and material arising from the construction of said improvement.

Signature of Authorized Officer: *
T.A. Oberst

Date: _/ [ [I*

3/18/2021

Title: *

Vice President
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POA-8197868

BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT BOND
(Section 153.571, Ohio Revised Code)

KINOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS,

That we, the undersigned  THE SHELLY COMPANY

__P.0.BOX 3100, FINDLAY, OH 44840
(Mame and Address)

as Principal and LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY

(licensed to do business in the State of Ohio) as Surety, are hereby held and firmly bound

unto____Board of Logan County Commissioners

hereinafter called Obligee, in the penal sum of the dollar amount of the bid submitted by the

Principal to the Obligee on 18th day of _ March ,20 o1

to undertake the project known as: _ 2021 County Roadway Resurfacing

Shelly Project Number 915004

The penal sum referred to herein shall be the dollar amount of the Principal’s bid to the
Obligee, incorporating any additive or deductive alternate proposals made by the Principal on the

date referred to above to the Obligee, which are acéepted by the Obligee. In no case shall the

penal sum exceed the amount of - dollars

$ ). (If the above line is left blank the penal sum will be the amount of the
Principal’s bid, including alternates. Alternatively, if completed, the amount stated must not be
less than the full amount of the bid, including alternates, in dollars and cents. A percentage is
not acceptable.) For the payment of the penal sum will and truly to be made, we hereby jointly
and severally bind ourselves, our heirs, executors, administrators, successors and assigns.

THE CONDITION OF THE ABOVE OBLIGATIONS IS SUCH, that whereas the above

named Principal has submitted a bid on the above referred project:




NOW, TIHHEREFORE, if the Obligee accepts the bid of the Principal and the Principal
fails to enter into a proper contract in accordance with the bid, plans, details, specifications and
bills for material, and in the event the Principal pays to the Obligee the difference not to exceed
ten percent (10%) of the penalty hereof between the amount specified in the bid and such larger
amount for which the Obligee may be in good faith contract with the next lowest bidder to
perform the work covered by the bid; or in the event the Obligee does not award the contract to
the next lowest bidder and resubmits the project for bidding, the Principal will pay the Obligee
the difference not to exceed ten percent (10%) of the penalty hereof between the amount
specified in the bid, or the costs, in connection with the resubmission, of printing new contract
documents, required advertising and printing and mailing notices to prospective bidders,
whichever is less, then this obligation shall be void, otherwise to remain in full force and effect.
If the Obligee accepts the bid of the Principal and the Principal within ten (10) days after the
awarding of the contract, enters into a proper contract in accordance with the bid, plans, details,
specifications, and bills of material, which said contract is made a part of this bond the same as
though sct forth herein; and

IF THE SAID Principal shall well and faithfully perform each and every condition of
such contract; and indemnify the Obligee against all damage suffered by failure to perform such
contract according to the provisions thereof and in accordance with the plans, details,
specifications, and bills of material therefore; and shall pay all lawful claims of subcontractors,
materialmen, and laborers, for labor performed and materials furnished in the carrying forward,
performing, or completing of said contract; we agreeing and assenting that this undertaking shall
be for the benefit of any materialman or laborer having a just claim, as well as for the Obligec

herein; then this obligation shall be void; otherwise the same shall remain in full force and effect;




it being expressly understood and agreed that the liability of the Surety for any and all claims
hereunder shall in no event exceed the penal amount of this obligation as herein stated.

THE SAID Surcty hereby stipulates and agrees that no modifications, omissions, or
additions in or to the terms of said contract or in or to the plans and specifications thercfore shall
in any way affect thc obligations of said Surety on its bond, and it docs hereby waive notice of

any such modifications, omissions or additions to the terms of the contract or to the work or to

the specifications.

SIGNED AND SEALED THIS /7" day of b e d 20,9/ .
£
PRINCIPAL: THE SHEELY COMPANY SURETY COMPANY ADDRI:SS
p . {Bond Department)
W/ e @ Liberty Mutual Insurance Company
& Vv Company Name
TITLE: j,"('(, /’,)r </dewt 8044 Montgomery Rd., Ste. 150
Street
SURETY: - Cincinnati OI11 45236
City State Zip
Liberty Mutual Insurance Company 513-792-1873 S
A \ Telephone
. t__—_-—-______‘-_—_‘-'_“-___
B .
1 4 ,l,. E . - e

801-533-3624

Telephone Number

SURETY AGENT’S ADDRESS

Marsh USA, Inc,
Agency Name

15 W. South Temple, Ste. 700
Street
_Salt Lake City, UT" 84101
City State Zip
801-533-3624

Telephone




11 Power of Attorney Hmits the acts of tNoss namea heremn, and they have No authonty W
bind the Company except in the manner and to the extent herein stated.

»
X leert_y Liberty Mutual Insurance Gompany
, Mutual. The Ohio Casualty Insurance Company Uertiicale No: 8197868
e ngéH West American Insurance Company
POWER OF ATTORNEY

KNUWN ALL PERSUNS BY (HESE PRESENIS: Ihat [he Uhio Casualty Insurance Company Is a corporation duly organized under the laws of the State of New Hampshire, that
Liberty Mutual Insurance Company is a corporation duly organized under the laws of the State of Massachuselis, and West American Insurance Company is a corporalion duly organized
under the laws of the State of Indiana (herein colleciively called the "Companies™), pursuant fo and by authority hereln set forth, does hereby name, constitute and appoint,

Lisa Hall, Linda Lee Nipper, Tina Davis, Lindsey Plattner

airortheTiy o B4l LAk City stateor U1
execute, seal, aCKnOWieTys 2t detiver, foramionils Mnaliammmmmu any and aII undenakmgs bonds recogmzances and other surely obugahons, in pursuanoe
of these presents and shall be as hinding upon the Companies as if they have been duly signed by the president and atlested by the secretary of the Companies in their own proper

persons.
IN WITNESS WHEREQF, this Power of Aliorney has been subscribed by an authorized officer or official of the Companies and the corporate seals of the Companies have been affixed
thereto this  s1st  dayof  wewoer |, zv1s .

Liberty Mutual insurance Company

currency rate, interest rate or residual value guarantees.

Not valid for mortgage, note, loan, letter of credit,

The Ohio Casualty Insurance Company
Wast American Insurance Company

]

BT arey, sns i Secretary

State of PENNSYLVANIA
County of MONTGOMERY

Onthis sist dayof wUciover , Zuis before me personally appeared David M. Carey, who acknowledged himself to be the Assistant Secretary of Liberly Mutual Insurancs
Company, Te Ohio Castalty Company, and Wast American Insurance Company, and that he, as such, being authorized so to do, execute the foregoing Instrument for the purposes
therein contained by signing on behalf of the corporations by himsslf as a duly authorized officer.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have hereunto subscribed my name and affixed my natarial seal at King of Prussia, Pennsylvania, on the day and year first above written,

COMMONWEALTH OF PENNSYLVANIA

(e
mv,s < ALTH OF PENNSYLVANIA
o‘ TG Notariel Seat
v
U K Teresa Pastelta, Nolary Public /\ z ZE g! .
| Upper Merian Twp., Monlgomery County | By:

SYL‘W: My Commission Expires March 28, 2021 SresaFas 7 Y PUBiG
4HY v U Member, Pennsylvania Association of Nolaries

This Power of Attorney is made and executed pursuant fo and by authority of the following By-laws and Authorizations of The Ohio Casualty Insurance Company, Liberty Mutual
Insurance Company, and West American Insurance Company which resolutions are now in full force and effect reading as follows:

ARTICLE {V - OFFICERS: Saction 12, Powaer of Attarney.
Any officer or other official of the Corporation authorized for that purpose in writing by the Chairman or the President, and subject to such limitation as the Chairman or the :
President may preseribe, shall appoint such attorneys-in-fact, as may be necessary to act in behalf of the Corporation to make, execule, seal, acknowlsdge and deliver as surety
any and all underlakings, bonds, recognizances and other surety obligations. Such attorneys-in-fact, subject to the imitatlons set forih In their respsctive powers of atiomey, shal
have full power to bind the Corporation by their signature and execution of any such instruments and to attach thereto the seal of the Corporation. When so executed, sucli
instruments shall be as binding as if signed by the President and attested to by the Secretary. Any power or authority granted to any representative or attomey-in-fact under the
provisions of this article may be revoked at any time by the Board, the Chalrman, the President or by the officer or officers granting such power or authorlty.
ARTICLE XIll - Execution of Contracts: Sectlon 5. Surety Bonds and UndsHakings.
Any officer of the Gompany authorized for that purpose in writing by the chairman or the president, and subject to such limitations as the chairman or the president may prescribe
shall appoint such attorneys-in-fact, as may be necessary to act in behalf of the Company to make, execule, seal, acknowledge and deliver as surely any and all undertakings|
bonds, recognizances and other surety obligations. Such altomneys-In-fact subject to the limitalions set forth in thelr respactive powers of attormay, shall have full power to bind the
Company by their signalure and execution of any such instruments and to attach thereto the seal of the Company. When so executed such instruments shall be as binding as if
signed by the president and atlested by the secretary.
Certificate of Deslgnation — The President of the Company, acting pursuant to the Bylaws of the Company, authorizes David M. Carey, Assistant Secretary to appolnt such attorneys-in-
fact as may be necessary {o act on behall of the Company to make, execute, seal, acknowledge and deliver as surety any and all undertakings, bonds, recognizances and other surety
obligations.
Authorizatlon — By unanimous consent of the Company's Board of Directors, the Company consents that facsimile or mechanically reproduced signature of any assistant secretary of the
Company, wheraver appearing upon a certified copy of any powar of attorney issued by the Company in connection with surety bands, shall be valid and binding upon the Company with
the same force and effect as though manually affixed.
|, Renea C. Llewellyn, the undersigned, Assistant Secretary, The Ohio Casually Insurance Company, Liberty Mutual Insurance Company, and West American Insurance Company do
hereby certify that the original power of attorney of which the foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of the Power of Attomey executed by said Companies, is in full force and effect and
has not baen revoked. p _
IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, I have hersunto set my hand and affixed the seals of said Companies this Cdayof 0L oA L

To confirm the validity of this Power of Attorney call

Renee C. Llewellyn, Assistant Secretary

LMS-12873 LMIC OCIC WAIC Mulll Co_082018




Ohio Department of Insurance

Office of Risk Assessment

50 West Town Strest

Third Floor - Suite 300 Mike DeWine - Governor
Columbus,Chio 43215 . e
(614)644-2658 Jillian Froment - Director
e Certificate of Compliance

www.insurance,chio.gov

Issued 03/20/2020

Effective 04/02/2020
Expires 04/01/2021

I, Jillian Froment, hereby certify that I am the Director of Insurance in the State of Ohio and have supervision of
insurance business in said State and as such I hereby certify that

LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY

of Massachusetts is duly organized under the laws of this State and is anthorized to transact the business of insurance
under the following section(s) of the Ohio Revised Code:

Section 39292.01 (A)

Accident & Health Guaranteed Renewable A & H
Aircraft Inland Marine

Allied Lines Medical Malpractice -

Boiler & Machinery Multiple Peril - Commercial
Burglary & Theft Multiple Peril - Farmowners
Collectively Renewable A & H Multiple Peril - Homeowners
Commercial Auto - Liability Noncancellable A & H
Commercial Auto - No Fault Nonrenew-Stated Reasons (A&H)
Commercial Auto - Physical Damage Ocean Marine

Credit . Other Accident only

Credit Accident & Health Other Liability

Earthquake Private Passenger Auto - Liability
Fidelity Private Passenger Auto - No Fault
Financial Guaranty - Private Passenger Auto - Physical Damage
Fire Surety

Glass Workers Compensation

Group Accident & Health

R TU. S CE CO certified in its annual statement to this Department as of Decernber
31,2019 that it has admitted assets in the amount of $51,103,579,523, liabilities in the amount of $34,292,195,090, and

surplus of at least $16,811,384,434.
IN WITNESS WEEREOF, I have hereunta subscribed my name and caused my seal to be affixed at Columbus, Ohio,
this day and date.

%W !

Jillitan Froment,Director

Aceredited by the Natlonal Aesoclation of Insurance Commissioners (NAIC)

INS7230{Rev.6/2003)



SURETY
Assets
Cash and Bank Deposits $778,754,989
*Bonds — U.S GOVEMMENL ........cveemremmesisnssisnssarsons 2,780,808,610
*Other Bonds... .. 12,645,608,792
FBLOCKS 1avetiurimransssssansuntssissesionsasmnesenrnenssnasmsssssonsnisasss 16,385,435,431
Real Bstate 235,608,378
Agents’ Balances or Uncollected Premiums........... 6,217,983,641
Accrued Interest and Rents 102,273,390
Other Admitted ASSetS..ciirrnsicsniesssmnsessinie 11,957,106,292
Total Admitted Asseis ......... S— T $51,103,579.523

LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY

FINANCIAL STATEMENT — DECEMBER 31, 2019

Liabilities

Uneamned Premiums $8,007,146,482
Reserve for Claims and Claims Expense .... . 21,532,853,787
Funds Held Under Reinsurance Treaties....ovine. 507,868,920
Reserve for Dividends to Policyholders......ccvveunsee 1,143,826
Additional Statutory Reserve.......cimveenireinseenrene 125,722,000
Reserve for Commissions, Taxes and

Other Liabilities ....... 4,117,460,075

Total ..o §34,292,195,090
Special Surplus Funds.......ceuvneens $32,768,443
Capital StocK, e eneeaniirianaerans 10,000,075
Paid in Surplus.....covecnsninenee e 10,044,978,933
Unassigned Surplus......eceeerisve 6,723,636,983
. Surplus to Policyholders. s e 16,811,384,434

Total Liabilities and Surplus........

* Bonds are stated at amortized or Investment value; Stocks at Association Market Values.
The foregoing financial information is taken from Liberty Mutual Insurance Company’s financial
staternent filed with the state of Massachugetts Department of Insurance.

1, TIM MIKOLAJEWSKI, Assistant Secretary of Liberty Mutual Insurance Company, do hereby certify that the foregoing is a true, and
comect statement of the Assets and Liabilities of said Corporation, as of December 31, 2019, to the best of my knowledge and belief.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed the seal of said Corporation at Seattle, Washingion, this 27% day of

March, 2020,

$-1262LMIC/a 3/20

WW'

Assistant Secretary




Oh - ( Department of
lO Administrative Services

Mike DeWine Matt Damschroder
Jon Husted

11/23/2020

Ty Nofziger

Shelly Company

80 Park Drive
Thornville, OH 43076

Subject: Certificate of Compliance Certification
Status: In Compliance
Effective Dates: 11/23/2020 through 05/21/2021

Dear Ty Nofziger:

The Equal Opportunity Division of the Ohio Department of Administrative Services (Division) hereby issues
Shelly Company a Certificate of Compliance. The Certificate shall be in force for 180 days from the date of

issuance.

Section 9.47 of the Revised Code requires the Division to review affirmative action programs and plans of
each company desiring to participate on state-assisted construction contracts and determine whether that
company has violated any affirmative action programs and goals for which that company was obligated to
meet during the preceding five years. Based on the above-referenced review, the Division has found no such

violation(s).

Please be advised that for Shelly Company to maintain certification status, Shelly Company must continue to
ensure equal employment opportunities in accordance with applicable State and Federal EEO laws, rules,
regulations and guidelines, and meet those contractual obligations for which Shelly Company has agreed.

Sincerely,

G uthot

Eric M. Seabrook
Deputy Director
State EEO Coordinator

Equal Opportunity Division 614-466-8380 | Phone
4200 Surface Road 614-728-5628 | FAX
Columbus, Ohio 43228 das.eod@das.chio.gov| email: das.ohio.gov

The State of Ohio is an equal opportunity employer



s Bureau of Workers’
Oth ’ Compensation

30 W, Spring St.

Columbus OH 43215-2256

Governor Mike DeWine
Administrator/CEC Stephanie McCloud

www.bwc.ohio.gov
1-800-644-6292

CERTIFICATE OF EMPLOYER'S
RIGHT TO PAY COMPENSATION DIRECTLY

To be posted in employer’s place or places of employment in compliance with Section 4123.83 of the
Ohio Revised Code. Any employer requiring more than one copy of this certificate, may reproduce as

many copies (without any alterations or changes) as required.

Policy Number and Employer Name 20004108

THE SHELLY HOLDING COMPANY

Period Specified Below

August 1, 2020

PO BOX 266 to
THORNVILLE, OH 43076-0266 August 1, 2021
Sub(s):
20004108-027 OLDCASTLE MATERIALS CEMENT HOLDINGS INC

20004108-026
20004108-025
20004108-024
20004108-022
20004108-020
20004108-019
20004108-002

APAC, INC.

ALL OHIO READY-MIX TRANSPORTATION INC
STONECQ, INC

COLUMBUS LIMESTONE

MARBLE CLIFF LIMESTONE INC

SHELLY MATERIALS, INC

THE SHELLY COMPANY

This certifies that on date hereof the above named employer having met the requirements provided in
Section 4123.35 of the Ohio Revised Code has been granted authority by the administrator to pay
compensation directly to its injured or dependents of killed employees as provided in said Section for
the period above set forth.

Sincerely,

y 4
Sphan. M ouol
Stephanie McCloud
Administrator/CEO

BWC-7201
Si-1




